
Economic Development (2014 Fees) (Amendment) (Jersey) 
Order 2013 Article 1 

 

 ◊  Page - 1 
 

 

 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT (2014 FEES) 

(AMENDMENT) (JERSEY) ORDER 2013 

Made   
Coming into force   

THE MINISTER FOR ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, in pursuance of 
Regulation 7 of the Sea Fisheries (Licensing of Fishing Boats) (Jersey) 
Regulations 2003, Regulation 3 of the Sea Fisheries (Underwater Fishing)  
(Jersey) Regulations 2003 and Regulations 2 and 5 of the Sea Fisheries 
(Fisheries) (Jersey) Regulations 2010, orders as follows – 

1 Economic Development (2014 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2013 amended 

In the Economic Development (2014 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2013 – 

(a) in the preamble, for the words “and Articles 12 and 38 of the Weights and 
Measures (Jersey) Law 1967” there are substituted the words 
“, Articles 12 and 38 of the Weights and Measures (Jersey) Law 1967, 
Regulation 7 of the Sea Fisheries (Licensing of Fishing Boats) (Jersey) 
Regulations 2003, Regulation 3 of the Sea Fisheries (Underwater 
Fishing) (Jersey) Regulations 2003 and Regulations 2 and 5 of the Sea 
Fisheries (Fisheries) (Jersey) Regulation 2010”; 

(b) after Article 3 there is inserted the following Article – 

“3A Sea Fisheries (General Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 amended 

(1) In the Sea Fisheries (General Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 – 
(a) in Article 1 for the amount ‘£92.00’ there is substituted the 

amount ‘£94.30’; 
(b) in Article 2(a) for the amount ‘£80.95’ there is substituted 

the amount ‘£82.95’; 
(c) in Article 2(b) for the amount ‘£16.90’ there is substituted 

the amount ‘£17.30’; 
(d) in Article 3(1) for the amount ‘£167.50’ there is substituted 

the amount ‘£171.65’; 
(e) in Article 3(2)(a)(i) for the amount ‘£167.50’ there is 

substituted the amount ‘£171.65’; 



Article 2 
Economic Development (2014 Fees) (Amendment) (Jersey) 

Order 2013 
 

 
Page - 2  ◊  
 

(f) in Article 3(2)(a)(ii) for the amount ‘£25.40’ there is 
substituted the amount ‘£26.03’. 

(2) Despite Article 4(2), this Article comes into force on 1st 
January 2014.”. 

2 Citation and commencement 

This Order may be cited as the Economic Development (2014 Fees) 
(Amendment) (Jersey) Order 2013 and comes into force on 1st January 2014. 

 

 

Signed.................................................................... 

Date........................................................................ 

for and on behalf of 

Minister for Economic Development 

 
 



Economic Development (2014 Fees) (Amendment) (Jersey) 
Order 2013 Endnotes 

 

 ◊  Page - 3 
 

 

 


